
MY EXPERIENCE WITH SALVIA DIVINORUM

by Chuck Weiss


Saturday January 5, 2002  (early afternoon)


My friend, Paul, arrived with the Salvia Divinorum at about one in the afternoon, a little earlier 
than I had expected.  He had told me of his experience with the strong hallucinogen, and when I 
expressed an interest in trying it myself, he offered to guide me through the experience, and act 
as my protector while I was in such a veritable state.


I had decided to approach this experience as a spiritual journey, and was finishing sweeping and 
vacuuming my studio apartment so that the Salvia entity wouldn’t be hampered by old dust and 
clutter.


I’m a pagan spiritually, and have a permanent alter set up in my living space.  I asked the Ancient 
Ones to show me what I most needed to learn during my shamanistic journey.  I then sat down 
beside Paul and watched him fill the pipe’s bowl with a pinch of finely ground Salvia leaf, which 
had been “enhanced” with Salvia extract.  As my friend explained, adding the extract made it 
possible to experience the Salvia high without having to smoke “a cereal bowl” full of the natural 
leaf.


I held the flame of my lighter just above the bowl and drew it down into the leafy material.  As I 
held the smoke in my lungs, I set the pipe down and settled back into a comfortable position on 
the sofa.  About 5 seconds later, I had my first indication that I wasn’t in Kansas anymore.  There 
directly in front of me, superimposed over my room, was a little white cottage with a freshly 
mowed front lawn, surrounded by a white picket fence, straight out of Disneyland!  A second or 
two later, my peripheral vision on both sides began to bend all the way up to form a tunnel, with 
the cottage still in front of me.  There it stayed for a few more seconds then came back down.  
The cottage vanished and things returned to normal.  Well, not quite.  I felt light headed and my 
perceptions were still not right.  With some effort I found the will to speak and told my friend 
that the launch had evidently been aborted.  He suggested a second hit and I repeated the 
procedure.


This time I hardly had time to put the pipe down when the cottage reappeared, again 
superimposing itself over the room, and the sides began to bend upward as before.  By the time 
the tunnel had formed, the room had completely vanished, leaving me completely alone and 
disconnected from this world.  The walls of the tunnel began to twist at the far end, enveloping 
the cottage.  The twisting motion continued as it consumed the tunnel, coming straight toward 
me.  I felt very apprehensive, and felt myself sweating profusely, especially on the forehead.  I 
raised my hand and wiped the sweat from my brow.  The feeling of my hand against my skin was 
reassuring.  At least I still had a body, even though I couldn’t see it.  I must have said something 
because I heard my friend’s voice off in the distance reminding me that my journey was 
supposed to be a short one and that I would soon return.  (Saliva journeys are said to last but a 
few minutes, although it always seems much longer.)  I replied, as best as I was able, that I 



appreciated his reassurance, but the twisting motion was still approaching and my anxiety didn’t 
subside.


Soon the twisting was upon me and I physically felt the torque as my body twisted out of 
existence.  Then it was up to my head.  I saw everything turn upside down and felt my mind 
being turned inside out.  I knew that the physical world had being torn away from me and I was 
in mortal fear that I wasn’t going to be allowed to return.  I was now in some kind of surreal 
environment, almost cartoon-like with bright primary colors.


I felt a communication of some sort telling me, that not only was I disconnected from all that I 
had known before, but that the world I came from, my friends, my family, my previous life 
hadn’t really existed, ever!  It felt like I had just woken up from a slumber, a warm cozy 
comfortable sleep, only to be told that what I had thought was real had been but a dream, and the 
reality to which I had just awaken was mocking me.


I felt like my friend had played a terrible trick on me.  If only I hadn’t been so foolish and taken 
that horrible drug, I would still be with what was comfortable and familiar, instead of being 
trapped in this terrible cartoon reality.  But, I knew the real world existed.  I could still remember 
pieces of it.  I couldn’t,  wouldn’t, accept this!  With all the force I could muster, I rebelled 
against my new existence.  Then, the grip that had held my mind vanished.


The tunnel suddenly receded to its previous size and shape.  I felt relieved, but the twisting 
started again and advanced toward me, much more quickly this time.  It devoured my body again 
with the same physical sensations that I had felt before.  Again it swallowed my mind, turning it 
inside out, all the while telling me that my connections to the physical world were lost forever, 
that this was my reality, now and forever more, and that it always had been.  Again I rebelled, 
literally fighting for my life, and again the tunnel receded, only to attack me for a third time.


In the middle of my third battle with the twisting tunnel, it suddenly backed off and unfolded, 
revealing the cottage, with its freshly mowed lawn and picket fence, all superimposed over my 
room . . . my blessed room.  The cottage quickly evaporated and I was home again.


My evaluation of the experience is this.  I had asked the gods to show me what I needed to learn 
and I believe they responded.  My struggle with the twisting tunnel was a fight against death, the 
death of my ego.  My identity is evidently tied to this physical reality.  With its twisting and 
turning, the tunnel was trying to sever all the connections I have to this world, but my fear 
wouldn’t allow me to surrender to such a “death.”
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